

DAFTAR PUSTAKA

- Ali, H.A.E.M., Al-Sulaihi, I.A. and Al-Gahtani, K.S., 2013. Indicators for measuring performance of building construction companies in Kingdom of Saudi Arabia. *Journal of King Saud University - Engineering Sciences*, 25(2), pp.125–134. Available at: <http://linkinghub.elsevier.com/retrieve/pii/S1018363912000074> [Accessed September 12, 2013].
- Alwi, S., 2001. *Manajemen Sumber Daya Manusia Strategi Keunggulan Kompetitif*, Yogyakarta: BPFE.
- Amaratunga, D., Baldry, D. and Sarshar, M., 2000. Performance Evaluation in Facilities Management: Using The Balance Score Card Approach. In *COBRA 2000 Conference*. pp. 1–15.
- Asiyanto, 2009. *Manajemen Resiko Untuk Kontraktor Pertama.*, Jakarta: PT. Pradnya Paramita.
- Astana, I.N.Y., 2014. Penelitian Pendahuluan Model Hubungan Strategi Penawaran Terhadap Kinerja Proyek dan Perusahaan Konstruksi.
- Astana, I.N.Y., Rusdi, HA. and Wibowo, M.A., 2015. Factors Affecting Bidding Strategy in Construction. *Australian Journal of Basic and Applied Sciences*, 9(March), pp.211–215.
- Astana, I.N.Y., Rusdi, HA. and Wibowo, M.A., 2014. Influence of Bidding Strategy on Project Performance in Construction. *Advances in Natural and Applied Science*, 9(May), pp.65–71.
- Asyiwati, Y., 2002. *Penataan Ruang Wilayah Pesisir Kabupaten Bantul, Propinsi Daerah Istimewa Yogyakarta*. Institut Pertanian Bogor.
- Atkinson, R., 1999. Project Management; Cost, Time and Quality, Two best guesses and phenomenon, its time to accept other success criteria. *International Journal of Project Management*, 17(6), pp.337–342.
- Babbie, E.R., 2012. *The Practice of Social Research* 13th Editi., Belmont,CA.: Wadsworth Publishing.
- Bageis, A.S. and Fortune, C., 2009. Factors affecting the bid/no bid decision in the Saudi Arabian construction contractors. *Construction Management and Economics*, 27(1), pp.53–71. Available at: <http://www.tandfonline.com/doi/abs/10.1080/01446190802596220> [Accessed June 21, 2013].
- Bagies, A. and Fortune, C., 2006a. Bid / No-Bid Decision Modelling For Construction Projects. , (September), pp.511–521.
- Bagies, A. and Fortune, C., 2006b. Bid/ No-Bid Decesion Modeling For Construction Projects. In *Annual ARCOM Conference*. Birmingham, UK, pp. 511–521.
- Barclay, C. and Osei-Bryson, K.-M., 2010. Project performance development framework: An approach for developing performance criteria & measures for information systems (IS) projects. *International Journal of Production Economics*, 124(1), pp.272–292. Available at: <http://linkinghub.elsevier.com/retrieve/pii/S0925527309004289>.
- Beatham, S., Anumba, C., Thorpe, T., Hedges, I., 2004. KPIs: A Critical Appraisal of Their Use in Construction. *An International Journal*, 11 No.1, pp.93–117.
- Bititci, U.S., Carrie, A.S. and MCDevit, L., 1997. Integrated Performance Measurement Systems. *International Journal Of Operations & Production*, 17(5), pp.522–534.
- BPS, 2010. *Statistik Konstruksi Indonesia*, Available at: <http://www.bps.go.id>.
- BPS, 2011. *Data Strategis BPS*, Available at: <http://www.bps.go.id>.

- BPS, 2012. *Data Strategis BPS*, Available at: <http://www.bps.go.id>.
- BPS, 2015. *Statistik Indonesia 2015*, Available at: <http://www.bps.go.id>.
- Budi, T.P., 2006. *SPSS 13.0 Terapan: Riset Statistik Parametrik*, Yogyakarta: Andi Yogyakarta.
- Chan, A.P.C. and Chan, A.P.L., 2004. Key Performance Indicators for Measuring Construction Success. *An International Journal*, 11(2), pp.203–221.
- Cheng, M.-Y., Hsiang, C-C., Tsai, H-C., Do, H-L., 2011. Bidding Decision Making for Construction Company using a Multi-criteria Prospect Model. *Journal of Civil Engineering and Management*, 17(3), pp.424–436. Available at: <http://www.tandfonline.com/doi/abs/10.3846/13923730.2011.598337> [Accessed September 12, 2013].
- Chua, O.B.D.K.H., 2000. Key factor in Bid Reasoning Model. *Journal of Construction Engineering and Management*, (October), pp.349–357.
- Cooke-Davies, T., 2002. The “real” success factors on projects. *International Journal of Project Management*, 20(3), pp.185–190. Available at: <http://linkinghub.elsevier.com/retrieve/pii/S0263786301000679>.
- Costa, J. and Singh, S., 2006. How do contractors evaluate company competitiveness and market attractiveness? The case of Toronto contractors. *Canadian Journal of Civil Engineering*, 33, pp.596–608.
- Darmono, R., 2005. Pemodelan System Dynamics Pada Perencanaan Penataan Ruang Kota. In *Seminar Nasional Aplikasi Teknologi Informasi 2005 (SNATI 2005)*. Yogyakarta.
- Dozzi, S.P., AbouRizk, S.M. and Schroeder, S.L., 1996. Utility Theory Model For Bid Markup Decesion. *Journal of Construction Engineering and Management*.
- Drew, D., Hing, P. Lo and Skitmore, R.M., 2001. The Effect of Client and Type and Size of Construction Work on Contractor’s Bidding Strategy. *Building and Environment*, 36, pp.393–406. Available at: <https://eprints.qut.edu.au/secure/00004117/01/DRAFT7.DOC>.
- Drew, D. and Skitmore, M., 1997. The effect of contract type and size on competitiveness in bidding. *Journal of Construction Management and Economics*, 15(5), pp.469–489.
- Egemen, M. and Mohamed, A.N., 2007. A framework for contractors to reach strategically correct bid/no bid and mark-up size decisions. *Building and Environment*, 01.
- Ervianto, W.I., 2004. *Teori Aplikasi Manajemen Proyek Konstruksi*, Yogyakarta: Andi Yogyakarta.
- Ferdinand, A., 2014. *Structural Equation Modeling dalam Penelitian Manajemen* 5th ed., Semarang: Badan Penerbit Universitas Diponegoro.
- Ferdinand, A., 2006. *Structure Equation Modelling*, Semarang: Badan Penerbit Universitas Diponegoro.
- Ghozali, I., 2011a. *Aplikasi Analisis Multivariate dengan Program IBM SPSS 19 Edisi 5.*, Semarang: Badan Penerbit Universitas Diponegoro.
- Ghozali, I., 2011b. *Structural Equation Modelling Metode Alternatif dengan Partial Least Square (PLS)* 3rd ed., Semarang: Badan Penerbit Universitas Diponegoro.
- Grant, R.M., 1995. *Contemporary Strategy Analysis , Concept, Techniques, Application*, USA: Blackwell Publisher Inc.

- Hanoum, S. and Fikrotuzzakiah, F., 2012. Perancangan Model Pengukuran Kinerja Project-Based Dengan Menggunakan Balanced Score Card. *Jurnal Teknik Pomits*, 1(1), pp.1–5.
- Hasan, M., 2003. *Pokok-Pokok Materi Statistik*, Jakarta: PT. Bumi Aksara.
- Helfert, E.A., 1996. *Guide to Measuring Business Performance* 9th ed., McGraw-Hill.
- Hollebeck, J.R., Trott, T.C., Kneitz, P., Berg, C., 2009. Bidding Strategies Help Manage Construction Budgets. In *Pipelines Specialty Conference*. San Diego, California, USA: American Society of Civil Engineers.
- Hung, T.W., 2004. Bidding Strategy: The Consultants' Perspective. *Disertasi*.
- Hunger, David J. and Wellen, T.L., 2001. *Manajemen Strategis Pertama*, Yogyakarta: Andi Yogyakarta.
- Husen, A., 2011. *Manajemen Proyek, Perencanaan, Penjadwalan & Pengendalian Proyek*, Yogyakarta: Andi Yogyakarta.
- Ibbs, C.W., Kwak, Y.H., Ng, T., Odabasi, A.M., 2003. Project Delivery Systems and Project Change : Quantitative Analysis. , (August), pp.382–387.
- Indramanik, I., 2004. *Kajian Strategi Pemasaran Perusahaan Pelaksana Jasa Konstruksi*. Institut Teknologi Bandung.
- Isik, Z., 2009. *A Conceptual Performance Measurement Framework For Construction Industry*. Middle East Technical University.
- Isik, Z., Arditi, D., Dikmen, I., Birgonul, M.T., 2010. Impact of Resources and Strategies on Construction Company Performance. *Journal Of Management in Engineering*, (January), pp.9–18.
- Kagioglou, M., Cooper, R. and Aouad, G., 2001. Performance Management in Construction: a conceptual framework. *Construction Management and Economics*, 19(1).
- Kale, S., Arditi, D. and Asce, M., 2002. Competitive Positioning in United States Construction Industry. , (June), pp.238–247.
- Kerzner, H.R., 2013. *Project Management: A Systems Approach to Planning, Scheduling, and Controlling* 11th ed., USA: Wiley.
- Kim, H. and Reinschmidt, K.F., 2011. Association of Risk Attitude with Market Diversification in the Construction Business. *Journal Of Management in Engineering*, (April), pp.66–75.
- Kim, H.J. and Reinschmidt, K.F., 2006. A dynamic competition model for construction contractors. *Construction Management and Economics*, 24(9), pp.955–965. Available at: <http://www.tandfonline.com/doi/abs/10.1080/01446190600799729> [Accessed June 21, 2013].
- Kotler, P., 1997. *Marketing Management Analysis Planning and Control* 9th Edition., New Jersey: Prentice Hall.
- Kristinayanti, W., 2012. Kajian Strategi Kotraktor Konstruksi. *Jurnal Matrix*, 2(1), pp.57–65.
- Laryea, S. and Hughes, W., 2011. Risk and Price in the Bidding Process of Contractors. *Journal of Construction Engineering and Management*, 137(April), pp.138–139.
- Latan, H. dan Ghozali, I., 2012a. *Partial Least Squares Konsep, Metode dan Aplikasi Menggunakan Program WarpPLS 2.0 untuk Penelitian Empiris*, Semarang: Badan Penerbit Universitas Diponegoro.
- Latan, H. dan Ghozali, I., 2012b. *Partial Least Squares Konsep, Teknik dan Aplikasi Smart PLS 2.0 M3*, Semarang: Badan Penerbit Universitas Diponegoro.

- Lee, S.H., Mora, F.V. and Park, M., 2006. Dynamic planning and control methodology for strategic and operational construction project management. *Construction Management and Information Technology*, 15, pp.84–97.
- Lembaga Pengembangan Jasa Konstruksi, 2008. *Peraturan Lembaga Pengembangan Jasa Konstruksi Nomor 11a Tahun 2008 Tentang Registrasi Usaha Jasa Pelaksana Konstruksi*, Republik Indonesia.
- Ling, F.Y.Y., Chan, S.L., Chong, E., Ee, L.P., 2004. Predicting Performance of Design-Build and Design-Bid-Build Projects. *Construction Engineering and Management*, 130, pp.75–83.
- Ling, F.Y.Y. and Bui, T.T.D., 2010. Factors Affecting Construction Project Outcomes: Case Study of Vietnam. *Journal of Professional Issues in Engineering Education and Practice*, 136(3), pp.148–155. Available at: [http://ascelibrary.org/doi/abs/10.1061/\(ASCE\)EI.1943-5541.0000013](http://ascelibrary.org/doi/abs/10.1061/(ASCE)EI.1943-5541.0000013).
- Ling, Y.Y., 2005. Discussion of “ Modeling a Contractor ’ s Markup Estimation ” by Min Liu. *Journal of Construction Engineering and Management*, 131(4), pp.391–399.
- Love, P.E.D. and Irani, Z., 2002. A project management quality cost information system for the construction industry.
- Lu, W., Shen, L. and Yam, M.C.H., 2008. Critical Success Factors for Competitiveness of Contractors: China Study. *Journal of Construction Engineering and Management*, (December), pp.972–982.
- Luthan, F., 2006. *Perilaku Organisasi* 10th Editi., Andi Yogyakarta.
- Ma, H., 2011. *Factors Affecting The Bid / No Bid Decision Making Process Of Small To Medium Size Contractors In Auckland*. Unitec New Zealand.
- Marzouk, M. and Moselhi, O., 2003. *A decision support tool for construction bidding*, Canada.
- Menteri Negara Lingkungan Hidup, 1994. *Keputusan Menteri Negara Lingkungan Hidup Nomor KEP-12/MENLH/3/1994 Tentang Pedoman Umum Upaya Pengelolaan Lingkungan Hidup (UKL) dan Upaya Pemantauan Lingkungan Hidup (UPL)*,
- Mochtar, K., 2010. Pricing Strategy of Indonesian Contractors. In *FIG Congress 2010, 11-16 April 2010*. Sydney, Australia, pp. 1–14.
- Moekijat, 1999. *Manajemen Tenaga Kerja dan Hubungan Kerja*, Bandung: CV. Pioner Jaya.
- Muhammadi, Aminulah, E. dan Soesilo, B., 2001. *Analisis Sistim Dinamis Pertama.*, Jakarta: UMJ Press Jakarta.
- Mulyadi, 2007. *Sistim Terpadu Pengelolaan Kinerja personel Berbasis Balanced Scorecard Pertama.*, Yogyakarta: UPP-STIM YKPN.
- Nagara, C., 2009. *Analisis Kelembagaan Antar Institusi Teknis Pengelola Jalan Dalam Penanganan Kerusakan Jalan Nasional dengan Pendekatan System Dynamics*.
- Nasid, A., Nordiana, W., Ali, W., Zainordin, Z.M., 2006. Effect Of Procurement System on The Performance of Construction Projects. , (1996), pp.1–13.
- Nazir, M., 2003. Metode Penelitian. In Jakarta: Ghalia Indonesia.
- Nugraha, P., Natan, I. dan Sutjipto, R., 1986. *Manajemen Proyek Konstruksi*, Surabaya: Penerbit Kartika Yudha.
- Oo, B., Drew, D.S. and Runeson, G., 2010. Competitor analysis in construction bidding. *Construction Management and Economics*, 28(12), pp.1321–1329. Available at:

- <http://www.tandfonline.com/doi/abs/10.1080/01446193.2010.520721> [Accessed June 21, 2013].
- Pemerintah Republik Indonesia, 1982. *Undang-undang No.4 Tahun 1982 tentang Ketentuan-ketentuan Pokok Pengelolaan Lingkungan Hidup*,
- Pemerintah Republik Indonesia, 2000. *Peraturan Pemerintah Republik Indonesia Nomor 29 Tahun 2000 Tentang Penyelenggaraan Jasa Konstruksi*,
- Pemerintah Republik Indonesia, 1999. *Undang-undang Nomor 18 tahun 1999, tentang Jasa Konstruksi*,
- Pemerintah Republik Indonesia, 1997. *Undang-undang No.23 Tahun 1997 tentang Pengelolaan Lingkungan Hidup*,
- Porter, M.E., 1980. *Competitive Strategy Techniques for Analyzing Industries and Competitors*, 1230 Avenue of the Americas new York, NY 10020: The Free Press A Division of Simon & Schuster Inc.
- Presiden Republik Indonesia, 1999. *Peraturan Pemerintah No. 27 Tahun 1999 tentang Analisis Mengenai Dampak Lingkungan*,
- Presiden Republik Indonesia, 2011. *Peraturan Presiden No. 35 Tahun 2011 tentang Perubahan Peraturan Presiden No. 54 Tahun 2010 tentang Pengadaan barang dan Jasa*,
- Presiden Republik Indonesia, 2010. *Peraturan Presiden Republik Indonesia Nomor 54 Tahun 2010 Tentang Pengadaan Barang/Jasa Pemerintah*,
- Presiden Republik Indonesia, 2012. *Peraturan Presiden No 70 Tahun 2012 tentang Perubahan Kedua Atas Peraturan Presiden Nomor 54 Tahun 2010 Tentang Pengadaan Barang dan Jasa*.
- Presiden Republik Indonesia, 2003. *Keputusan Presiden Republik Indonesia Nomor 80 Tahun 2003 Tentang Pedoman Pelaksanaan Pengadaan Barang dan Jasa Pemerintah*,
- Purnomo, H., 2012. *Pemodelan dan Simulasi Untuk Pengelolaan Adaptif Sumber Daya Alam dan Lingkungan*, Bogor: PT. Penenrbit IPB Press.
- Richardson, G.P. and Pugh, A.L., 1986. *Introduction to System Dynamics Modeling with Dynamo*, London, England: MIT Press Cambridge, Massachusete.
- Riduwan, 2005. *Metode dan Teknik Menyusun Tesis, Dilengkapi dengan Contoh Proposal*, Alfabeta Bandung.
- Riduwan, 2009. *Skala Pengukuran Variabel-variabel Penelitian*, Bandung: Alfabeta Bandung.
- Rusdi, H., 2011. Building Procurement System.
- Russel, J.S., 1992. Contractor Failure Analysis. *Journal of Performance of Constructed Facilities*, 5(3), pp.163–180.
- Sadikin, I., 2009. *Bunga Rampai Kriteria: Malcolm Baldrige National Quality Award (MBNQA) Edisi VI* :, Surabaya: Lembayung Centre Indonesia.
- Sanusi, A., 2011. *Metodologi Penelitian Bisnis*, Jakarta: Salemba Empat.
- Sarhan, S. and Fox, A., 2012. Performance Measurement in the UK Construction Industry and its Role in Supporting the Application of Lean. *Australian Journal of Construction Economics and Building*, 13, pp.23–35.
- Shash, A.A., 1993. Factors considered in tendering decisions by top UK contractors. *Construction Management and Economic*, 11(2), pp.111–118.
- Shen, L., Lu, W.S., Yam, M.C., 2006. Contractor Key Competitiveness Indicators : A China Study. , (April), pp.416–425.

- Shenhar, A.J., Ofer, L. and Dov, D., 1997. Mapping The Dimensions of Project Success. *Project Management Journal*, 28.1997,2, pp.p.5–13.
- Sholihin, M. dan Ratmono, D., 2013. *Analisis SEM-PLS dengan WarpPLS 3.0 Pertama.*, Jogjakarta: Andi Offset Yogyakarta.
- Simanihuruk, B., 2003. *Identifikasi Kesiapan Kontraktor Indonesia dalam menghadapi Globalisasi untuk meningkatkan persaingan.* Universitas Indonesia.
- Soeharto, I., 1997. *Manajemen Proyek dari Konseptual sampai Operasional*, Jakarta: Erlangga.
- Soemardi, B.W., 2008. Peningkatan Daya Saing Industri Konstruksi Nasional melalui Inovasi Konstruksi. *Konferensi Nasional Teknik Sipil 2 (Konteks 2)*, 2(KoNTekS 2), pp.978–979.
- Soemardi, B.W., 2007. Strategi Pemasaran: Suatu Tinjauan Terhadap Perusahaan Kontraktor di Indonesia. , pp.1–12.
- Soemardi, B.W., Wirahadikusumah, R.B. dan Abduh, M., 2006. Pengembangan model penilaian kinerja jasa konstruksi. In *Civil, International Conference, Engineering Sustainable, Towards Engineering, Civil Practice*. Surabaya, pp. 309–316.
- Soemardi, B.W., Wirahadikusumah, R.B. dan Abduh, M., 2007. Sistem Informasi Kinerja Industri Konstruksi Indonesia: Kebutuhan akan Benchmarking dan Integrasi Informasi. In *Konferensi Nasional Teknik Sipil I (Konteks I)*. Jogjakarta, pp. 11–12.
- Sterman, J.D., 2000. *Business Dynamic. System Thinking and Modelling for a Complex World*, The Mc Grow-Hill Company INC.
- Sugiyono, 2012a. *Metode Penelitian Bisnis* 16th ed., Bandung: Alfabeta Bandung.
- Sugiyono, 2012b. *Metode Penelitian Kuantitatif Kualitatif dan R&D* 16th ed., Bandung: Alfabeta Bandung.
- Sugiyono, 2012c. *Statistika Untuk Penelitian* 20th ed., Bandung: Alfabeta Bandung.
- Suliyanto, 2011. *Ekonometrika Terapan: Teori & Aplikasi dengan SPSS* Suyantoro, ed., Jogjakarta: Andi Offset Yogyakarta.
- Supriharyono, 2011. *Intisari Materi Kuliah Metodologi Penelitian*, Semarang: Program Pasca Sarjana Universitas Diponegoro.
- Suraji, Akhmad dan Pribadi, K., 2012. Membangun Struktur Industri Konstruksi Nasional Yang Kokoh, Andal dan Berdayasaing Serta Memberikan Kesempatan Kepada Para Pelaku Usaha Tumbuh Dan Berkembang Secara Adil Melalui Restrukturisasi Sistem.
- Susilawati, D., 2011. *System Dynamics Pengelolaan Sumber Daya Air Bersih*. Jakarta: Cintya Press Jakarta.
- Sutrisno, P., 1985. *Dasar-dasar Evaluasi Proyek dan Manajemen Proyek*, Yogyakarta: FE UGM.
- Talukhaba, A., Sidumedi, K.S. and Miruka, C.O., 2004. The Relationship Between Corporate Culture Of South African Construction Firm and Performance.
- Tan, Y., Shen, L., Asce, M., Langston, C., 2012. Competition Environment , Strategy , and Performance in the Hong Kong Construction Industry. *Journal of Construction Engineering and Management*, (March), pp.352–360.
- Tan, Y., Shen, L. and Langston, C., 2010. Contractors ' Competition Strategies in Bidding: Hong Kong Study. *Journal of Construction Engineering and Management*, (October), pp.1069–1077.
- Tunggal, A.W., 2011. *Contemporary Strategic Management*, Jakarta: Harvarindo.

- Vandevelde, A., Van Dierdonck, R. and Debackere, K., 2005. Practitioner's View On Project Performance: A Three-polar Construct. In *Vlerick Leuven Gent management School Fellows*. Blackwell Publisher Inc., pp. pp. 3–34.
- Veronica, A., Riantini, L.S. and Firmansyah, B.A., 2008. Identification of the factors in corporate management that influence construction company's performance in Indonesia. *Innovation in Structural Engineering and Construction*.
- Waluyo, R., 2014. *Model Hubungan Antara Culture, Knowledge Management dan Performance di Perusahaan Konstruksi*. Diponegoro University.
- Wang, W.-C., Dzung, R.-J. and Lu, Y.-H., 2007. Integration of Simulation-Based Cost Model and Multi-Criteria Evaluation Model for Bid Price Decisions. In *Computer-Aided Civil and Infrastructure Engineering*. USA, UK: Blackwell Publishing, pp. 223–235. Available at: <http://doi.wiley.com/10.1111/j.1467-8667.2007.00480.x>.
- Wibowo, K., 2007. *Faktor-faktor Strategi Pengembangan Daya saing Kontraktor Indonesia, Hibah Bersaing DIKTI*, Jakarta.
- Wibowo, K., 2011. *Strategi Bisnis Kontraktor Indonesia Dalam Usaha Peningkatan Daya Saing*.
- Wibowo, M.A., 2004. *Modeling Labour Intensive Construction and Its Effect on A Developing Economy*. University Of Nottingham, UK.
- Wibowo, M.A. dan Hadihardaja, J., 2006. Badan Akreditasi Nasional Industri Konstruksi. , pp.277–286.
- Widoyoko, S.E.P., 2012. *Teknik Penyusunan Instrumen Penelitian Pertama.*, Yogyakarta: Pustaka Pelajar.
- Wong, J.T.Y. and Hui, E.C.M., 2006. Construction Project Risks: Further Considerations for Constructors' Pricing in Hong Kong. *Construction Management and Economics*, 24(4), pp.425–438. Available at: <http://www.tandfonline.com/doi/abs/10.1080/01446190600601602> [Accessed February 21, 2016].
- Yean, F., Ling, Y., Low, S.P., Wang, S., Egbelakin, T., 2009. Models for Predicting Project Performance in China Using Project Management Practices Adopted by Foreign AEC Firms. *Journal of Construction Engineering and Management*, (December 2008), pp.983–990.
- Yu, W. and Wang, K.-W., 2012. Best Value or Lowest Bid? A Quantitative Perspective. *Journal of Construction Engineering and Management*, (January), pp.128–134.
- Zhao, Z.Y., Shen, L.Y., Asce, M., Zuo, J., 2009. Performance and Strategy of Chinese Contractors in the International Market. *Journal of Construction Engineering and Management*, (February), pp.108–118.